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NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE'S SALE TS No.:
VAD.077-159 APN:
6241-031-009 Title Or-
der No.: 1337412CAD
NOTE: THERE IS A
SUMMARY OF THE
I N F O R M A T I O N I N
THIS DOCUMENT AT-
TACHED. YOU ARE IN
DEFAULT UNDER A
D E E D O F T R U S T
DATED 5/26/2017. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
TION TO PROTECT
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A
PUBLIC SALE. IF YOU
NEED AN EXPLANA-
T I O N O F T H E
N A T U R E O F T H E
P R O C E E D I N G
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. A publ ic
auct ion sale to the
highest bidder for cash,
cashier's check drawn
on a state or national
bank, check drawn by
a state or federal cred-
it union, or a check
drawn by a state or
federal savings and
loan association, or
savings association, or
savings bank specified
in Section 5102 of the
Financial Code and au-
thorized to do busi-
ness in this state will
be held by the duly ap-
po in ted t rus tee as
shown below, of all
right, title, and interest
conveyed to and now
held by the trustee in
the hereinaf ter de-
scribed property under
and pursuant to a Deed
of Trust described be-
low. The sale will be
made, but without cov-
enant or warranty, ex-
pressed or implied, re-
garding title, posses-
sion, or encumbrances,
to pay the remaining
principal sum of the
note(s) secured by the
Deed of Trust, with in-
terest and late charges
thereon, as provided in
the note(s), advances,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, interest
thereon, fees, charges
and expenses of the
Trustee for the total
amount (at the time of
the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale)
reasonably estimated
to be set forth below.
The amount may be
greater on the day of
sale. Trustor: ROBERT
L GRAY, A SINGLE
MAN Duly Appointed
T r u s t e e : P R O B E R
AND RAPHAEL, ALC
Recorded 6/7/2017 as
I n s t r u m e n t N o .
20170626694 in book
N/A, page N/A of Offi-
cial Records in the of-
fice of the Recorder of
Los Angeles County,
Cal i forn ia, Date of
Sale: 1/29/2020 at
11:00 AM Place of
Sale: By the fountain
located at 400 Civic
Center Plaza, Pomona,
CA 91766 Amount of
unpaid balance and
o t h e r c h a r g e s :
$500,662.87 Street Ad-
dress or other com-
mon designation of real
property: 14906 CALLE
LAS BRISAS PARA-
MOUNT, CALIFOR-
NIA 90723 The under-
signed Trustee dis-
claims any liability for
any incorrectness of
the street address or
other common desig-
nation, if any, shown
above. If no street ad-
dress or other com-
mon designat ion is
shown, directions to
the locat ion of the
property may be ob-
tained by sending a
written request to the
beneficiary within 10
days of the date of first
publication of this No-
tice of Sale. NOTICE
TO POTENTIAL BID-
DERS: If you are con-
sidering bidding on this
p roper t y l i en , you
should understand that
there are r isks in-
volved in bidding at a
trustee auction. You
will be bidding on a li-
en, not on the property
i t se l f . P lac ing the
highest bid at a trustee
auction does not auto-
matically entitle you to
free and clear owner-
ship of the property.
You should also be
aware that the lien be-
ing auctioned off may
be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder
at the auction, you are
or may be responsible
for paying off all liens
senior to the lien being
auctioned off, before
you can receive clear
title to the property.
You are encouraged to
investigate the exist-
ence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens
that may exist on this
property by contacting
the county recorder's
office or a title insur-
ance company, either
of which may charge
you a fee for this in-
formation. If you con-
sult either of these re-
sources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
deed of trust on the
property. NOTICE TO
PROPERTY OWNER:
The sale date shown
on this notice of sale
may be postponed one
or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pur-
suant to Section 2924g
of the California Civil
Code. The law re-
quires that information
about trustee sale post-
ponements be made
available to you and to
the public, as a cour-
t esy to those no t
present at the sale. If
you w ish to lea rn
whether your sale date
has been postponed,
and, if applicable, the
rescheduled time and
date for the sale of this
property, you may call
(714) 730-2727 or visit
this Internet Web site
www.lpsasap.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case
VAD.077-159. Informa-
tion about postpone-
ments that are very
short in duration or that
occur close in time to
the scheduled sale
may not immediately
be reflected in the tele-
phone information or
on the Internet Web
site. The best way to
verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
D a t e : 1 2 / 1 9 / 2 0 1 9
P R O B E R A N D
RAPHAEL, ALC 20750
Ventura Blvd. #100
Woodland Hills, Califor-
nia 91364 Sale Line:
(714) 730-2727 Rita
Terzyan, Trustee Sale
Technician A-4713853
0 1 / 0 2 / 2 0 2 0 ,
0 1 / 0 9 / 2 0 2 0 ,
0 1 / 1 6 / 2 0 2 0
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WORKERS
COMPENSATION
APPEALS BOARD

SPECIAL NOTICE OF
LAWSUIT

Case Number:
ADJ3603299

DEFENDANT:
ROGELIO MARTIN

DELGADO aka
ROGER M.

DELGADO dba
FLASH MERCURY

FIRE
PROTECTION

APPLICANT(S):
BRUNO R.

MARTINEZ aka
ROSALIO MARTINEZ
DAVILA, Deceased

NOTICES
1) A lawsuit, the at-
tached Adjudication of
Claim, has been filed
with the Workers Com-
pensat ion, Appeals
Board against you as
the named defendant
by the above-named
applicant(s).
You may seek the ad-
vice of an attorney in
any matter connected
with this lawsuit and
such attorney should
be consulted promptly
so that your response
m a y b e f i l e d a n d
entered in a timely
fashion.
If you do not know an
attorney, you may call
an attorney reference
service or a legal aid
office (see telephone
directory)
You may also request
assistance/information
from an information
and Assistance Officer
of the Division of Work-
er Compensation (see
telephone directory)
2) An Answer to the
Application must be
filed and served within
six days of the service
of the Application pur-
suant to Appeals Board
rules, therefore, your
written response must
be filed with the Ap-
peals Board promptly;
a letter or phone call
will not protect your in-
terests.
3) You will be served
with a Notice(s) of
Hearing and must ap-
pear at all hearings or
con ferences . A f te r
such hearing, even ab-
sent your appearance,
a decis ion may be
made, and an award of
compensation benefits
may issue against you.
The award could result
in the garnishment of
your wages, taking of
your money or prop-
erty or other relief.
If the Appeals Board
m a k e s a n a w a r d
aga ins t you , you r
house or other dwell-
ing or other property
may be taken to satis-
fy that award in a non-
judicial sale, with no
exemptions from exe-
cution.
A lien may also be im-
posed upon your prop-
erty without further
hearing and before the
issuance of an award.
4) You must notify the
Appeals Board of the
Proper address for the
service of official no-
tices and papers and
not i fy the Appeals
Board of any changes
in that address.
TAKE  ACTION  NOW
TO  PROTECT  YOUR
INTERESTS! Workers
Compensa t ion Ap-
pea ls Board
Name and Address of
A p p e a l s B o a r d :
WCAB/LONG BEACH,
CA, 300 Oceangate
Drive, Ste. 200, Long
Beach, CA 90802-
4339. Completed by:
Name and Address of
Applicant's Attorney,
Representative (or Ap-
plicant if acting without
Attorney/Representat-
ive): Law Offices of
Dennis R. Fusi, 4909
Lakewood Blvd., 6th
Fl . , Lakewood, CA
90712. (310) 530-1888.
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON  SERVED: You
are served
1. as an individual de-
fendant. Rogelio Mar-
tin Delgado aka Roger
M. Delgado dba Flash
Mercury Fire Protection
4. by personal delivery
on:
Paramount  Journal-
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thereon, as provided in
the note(s), advances,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, interest
thereon, fees, charges
and expenses of the
Trustee for the total
amount (at the time of
the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale)
reasonably estimated
to be set forth below.
The amount may be
greater on the day of
sale. Trustor: ROBERT
L GRAY, A SINGLE
MAN Duly Appointed
T r u s t e e : P R O B E R
AND RAPHAEL, ALC
Recorded 6/7/2017 as
I n s t r u m e n t N o .
20170626694 in book
N/A, page N/A of Offi-
cial Records in the of-
fice of the Recorder of
Los Angeles County,
Cal i forn ia, Date of
Sale: 1/29/2020 at
11:00 AM Place of
Sale: By the fountain
located at 400 Civic
Center Plaza, Pomona,
CA 91766 Amount of
unpaid balance and
o t h e r c h a r g e s :
$500,662.87 Street Ad-
dress or other com-
mon designation of real
property: 14906 CALLE
LAS BRISAS PARA-
MOUNT, CALIFOR-
NIA 90723 The under-
signed Trustee dis-
claims any liability for
any incorrectness of
the street address or
other common desig-
nation, if any, shown
above. If no street ad-
dress or other com-
mon designat ion is
shown, directions to
the locat ion of the
property may be ob-
tained by sending a
written request to the
beneficiary within 10
days of the date of first
publication of this No-
tice of Sale. NOTICE
TO POTENTIAL BID-
DERS: If you are con-
sidering bidding on this
p roper t y l i en , you
should understand that
there are r isks in-
volved in bidding at a
trustee auction. You
will be bidding on a li-
en, not on the property
i t se l f . P lac ing the
highest bid at a trustee
auction does not auto-
matically entitle you to
free and clear owner-
ship of the property.
You should also be
aware that the lien be-
ing auctioned off may
be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder
at the auction, you are
or may be responsible
for paying off all liens
senior to the lien being
auctioned off, before
you can receive clear
title to the property.
You are encouraged to
investigate the exist-
ence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens
that may exist on this
property by contacting
the county recorder's
office or a title insur-
ance company, either
of which may charge
you a fee for this in-
formation. If you con-
sult either of these re-
sources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
deed of trust on the
property. NOTICE TO
PROPERTY OWNER:
The sale date shown
on this notice of sale
may be postponed one
or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pur-
suant to Section 2924g
of the California Civil
Code. The law re-
quires that information
about trustee sale post-
ponements be made
available to you and to
the public, as a cour-
t esy to those no t
present at the sale. If
you w ish to lea rn
whether your sale date
has been postponed,
and, if applicable, the
rescheduled time and
date for the sale of this
property, you may call
(714) 730-2727 or visit
this Internet Web site
www.lpsasap.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case
VAD.077-159. Informa-
tion about postpone-
ments that are very
short in duration or that
occur close in time to
the scheduled sale
may not immediately
be reflected in the tele-
phone information or
on the Internet Web
site. The best way to
verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
D a t e : 1 2 / 1 9 / 2 0 1 9
P R O B E R A N D
RAPHAEL, ALC 20750
Ventura Blvd. #100
Woodland Hills, Califor-
nia 91364 Sale Line:
(714) 730-2727 Rita
Terzyan, Trustee Sale
Technician A-4713853
0 1 / 0 2 / 2 0 2 0 ,
0 1 / 0 9 / 2 0 2 0 ,
0 1 / 1 6 / 2 0 2 0
Paramount  Journal
1/2,9,16/2020-91393
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WORKERS
COMPENSATION
APPEALS BOARD

SPECIAL NOTICE OF
LAWSUIT

Case Number:
ADJ3603299

DEFENDANT:
ROGELIO MARTIN

DELGADO aka
ROGER M.

DELGADO dba
FLASH MERCURY

FIRE
PROTECTION

APPLICANT(S):
BRUNO R.

MARTINEZ aka
ROSALIO MARTINEZ
DAVILA, Deceased

NOTICES
1) A lawsuit, the at-
tached Adjudication of
Claim, has been filed
with the Workers Com-
pensat ion, Appeals
Board against you as
the named defendant
by the above-named
applicant(s).
You may seek the ad-
vice of an attorney in
any matter connected
with this lawsuit and
such attorney should
be consulted promptly
so that your response
m a y b e f i l e d a n d
entered in a timely
fashion.
If you do not know an
attorney, you may call
an attorney reference
service or a legal aid
office (see telephone
directory)
You may also request
assistance/information
from an information
and Assistance Officer
of the Division of Work-
er Compensation (see
telephone directory)
2) An Answer to the
Application must be
filed and served within
six days of the service
of the Application pur-
suant to Appeals Board
rules, therefore, your
written response must
be filed with the Ap-
peals Board promptly;
a letter or phone call
will not protect your in-
terests.
3) You will be served
with a Notice(s) of
Hearing and must ap-
pear at all hearings or
con ferences . A f te r
such hearing, even ab-
sent your appearance,
a decis ion may be
made, and an award of
compensation benefits
may issue against you.
The award could result
in the garnishment of
your wages, taking of
your money or prop-
erty or other relief.
If the Appeals Board
m a k e s a n a w a r d
aga ins t you , you r
house or other dwell-
ing or other property
may be taken to satis-
fy that award in a non-
judicial sale, with no
exemptions from exe-
cution.
A lien may also be im-
posed upon your prop-
erty without further
hearing and before the
issuance of an award.
4) You must notify the
Appeals Board of the
Proper address for the
service of official no-
tices and papers and
not i fy the Appeals
Board of any changes
in that address.
TAKE  ACTION  NOW
TO  PROTECT  YOUR
INTERESTS! Workers
Compensa t ion Ap-
pea ls Board
Name and Address of
A p p e a l s B o a r d :
WCAB/LONG BEACH,
CA, 300 Oceangate
Drive, Ste. 200, Long
Beach, CA 90802-
4339. Completed by:
Name and Address of
Applicant's Attorney,
Representative (or Ap-
plicant if acting without
Attorney/Representat-
ive): Law Offices of
Dennis R. Fusi, 4909
Lakewood Blvd., 6th
Fl . , Lakewood, CA
90712. (310) 530-1888.
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON  SERVED: You
are served
1. as an individual de-
fendant. Rogelio Mar-
tin Delgado aka Roger
M. Delgado dba Flash
Mercury Fire Protection
4. by personal delivery
on:
Paramount  Journal-
12/19,26/19,1/2,9/2020
-91046
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WORKERS
COMPENSATION
APPEALS BOARD

SPECIAL NOTICE OF
LAWSUIT

Case Number:
ADJ3603299

DEFENDANT:
ROGELIO MARTIN

DELGADO aka
ROGER M.

DELGADO dba
FLASH MERCURY

FIRE
PROTECTION

APPLICANT(S):
BRUNO R.

MARTINEZ aka
ROSALIO MARTINEZ
DAVILA, Deceased

NOTICES
1) A lawsuit, the at-
tached Adjudication of
Claim, has been filed
with the Workers Com-
pensat ion, Appeals
Board against you as
the named defendant
by the above-named
applicant(s).
You may seek the ad-
vice of an attorney in
any matter connected
with this lawsuit and
such attorney should
be consulted promptly
so that your response
m a y b e f i l e d a n d
entered in a timely
fashion.
If you do not know an
attorney, you may call
an attorney reference
service or a legal aid
office (see telephone
directory)
You may also request
assistance/information
from an information
and Assistance Officer
of the Division of Work-
er Compensation (see
telephone directory)
2) An Answer to the
Application must be
filed and served within
six days of the service
of the Application pur-
suant to Appeals Board
rules, therefore, your
written response must
be filed with the Ap-
peals Board promptly;
a letter or phone call
will not protect your in-
terests.
3) You will be served
with a Notice(s) of
Hearing and must ap-
pear at all hearings or
con ferences . A f te r
such hearing, even ab-
sent your appearance,
a decis ion may be
made, and an award of
compensation benefits
may issue against you.
The award could result
in the garnishment of
your wages, taking of
your money or prop-
erty or other relief.
If the Appeals Board
m a k e s a n a w a r d
aga ins t you , you r
house or other dwell-
ing or other property
may be taken to satis-
fy that award in a non-
judicial sale, with no
exemptions from exe-
cution.
A lien may also be im-
posed upon your prop-
erty without further
hearing and before the
issuance of an award.
4) You must notify the
Appeals Board of the
Proper address for the
service of official no-
tices and papers and
not i fy the Appeals
Board of any changes
in that address.
TAKE  ACTION  NOW
TO  PROTECT  YOUR
INTERESTS! Workers
Compensa t ion Ap-
pea ls Board
Name and Address of
A p p e a l s B o a r d :
WCAB/LONG BEACH,
CA, 300 Oceangate
Drive, Ste. 200, Long
Beach, CA 90802-
4339. Completed by:
Name and Address of
Applicant's Attorney,
Representative (or Ap-
plicant if acting without
Attorney/Representat-
ive): Law Offices of
Dennis R. Fusi, 4909
Lakewood Blvd., 6th
Fl . , Lakewood, CA
90712. (310) 530-1888.
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON  SERVED: You
are served
1. as an individual de-
fendant. Rogelio Mar-
tin Delgado aka Roger
M. Delgado dba Flash
Mercury Fire Protection
4. by personal delivery
on:
Paramount  Journal-
12/19,26/19,1/2,9/2020
-91046
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WORKERS

COMPENSATION
APPEALS BOARD

SPECIAL NOTICE OF
LAWSUIT

Case Number:
ADJ3603299

DEFENDANT:
ROGELIO MARTIN

DELGADO aka
ROGER M.

DELGADO dba
FLASH MERCURY

FIRE
PROTECTION

APPLICANT(S):
BRUNO R.

MARTINEZ aka
ROSALIO MARTINEZ
DAVILA, Deceased

NOTICES
1) A lawsuit, the at-
tached Adjudication of
Claim, has been filed
with the Workers Com-
pensat ion, Appeals
Board against you as
the named defendant
by the above-named
applicant(s).
You may seek the ad-
vice of an attorney in
any matter connected
with this lawsuit and
such attorney should
be consulted promptly
so that your response
m a y b e f i l e d a n d
entered in a timely
fashion.
If you do not know an
attorney, you may call
an attorney reference
service or a legal aid
office (see telephone
directory)
You may also request
assistance/information
from an information
and Assistance Officer
of the Division of Work-
er Compensation (see
telephone directory)
2) An Answer to the
Application must be
filed and served within
six days of the service
of the Application pur-
suant to Appeals Board
rules, therefore, your
written response must
be filed with the Ap-
peals Board promptly;
a letter or phone call
will not protect your in-
terests.
3) You will be served
with a Notice(s) of
Hearing and must ap-
pear at all hearings or
con ferences . A f te r
such hearing, even ab-
sent your appearance,
a decis ion may be
made, and an award of
compensation benefits
may issue against you.
The award could result
in the garnishment of
your wages, taking of
your money or prop-
erty or other relief.
If the Appeals Board
m a k e s a n a w a r d
aga ins t you , you r
house or other dwell-
ing or other property
may be taken to satis-
fy that award in a non-
judicial sale, with no
exemptions from exe-
cution.
A lien may also be im-
posed upon your prop-
erty without further
hearing and before the
issuance of an award.
4) You must notify the
Appeals Board of the
Proper address for the
service of official no-
tices and papers and
not i fy the Appeals
Board of any changes
in that address.
TAKE  ACTION  NOW
TO  PROTECT  YOUR
INTERESTS! Workers
Compensa t ion Ap-
pea ls Board
Name and Address of
A p p e a l s B o a r d :
WCAB/LONG BEACH,
CA, 300 Oceangate
Drive, Ste. 200, Long
Beach, CA 90802-
4339. Completed by:
Name and Address of
Applicant's Attorney,
Representative (or Ap-
plicant if acting without
Attorney/Representat-
ive): Law Offices of
Dennis R. Fusi, 4909
Lakewood Blvd., 6th
Fl . , Lakewood, CA
90712. (310) 530-1888.
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON  SERVED: You
are served
1. as an individual de-
fendant. Rogelio Mar-
tin Delgado aka Roger
M. Delgado dba Flash
Mercury Fire Protection
4. by personal delivery
on:
Paramount  Journal-
12/19,26/19,1/2,9/2020
-91046
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CITY OF PARAMOUNT
LOS ANGELES COUNTY, CALIFORNIA

ORDINANCE SUMMARY OF
ORDINANCE NO. 1117/ZONING ORDINANCE

TEXT AMENDMENT NO. 12

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF PARAMOUNT, AMENDING OR-
DINANCE NO. 178, THE COMPREHENSIVE

ZONING ORDINANCE CHANGING THE OFFI-
CIAL ZONING MAP OF THE CITY OF PARA-

MOUNT FROM M-1 (LIGHT MANUFACTURING)
TO R-2 (MEDIUM-DENSITY RESIDENTIAL)

FOR PROPERTIES LOCATED AT 16350 AND
16313 HUNSAKER AVENUE IN THE CITY OF
PARAMOUNT, RELATIVE TO ZONE CHANGE

NO. 231

On November 3, 2019, the Paramount City Coun-
cil voted to introduce Ordinance No.1117 amend-
ing Ordinance No. 178, the comprehensive zon-
ing ordinance changing the official zoning map
from M-1 (Light Manufacturing to R-2 (Medium-
Density Residential) for properties located at
16350 and 16313 Hunsaker Avenue, relative to
Zone Change No. 231.

The City Council of the City of Paramount, adop-
ted Ordinance No. 1117 at the City Council meet-
ing on December 17, 2019 by the following roll
call vote:

AYES: Councilmembers Guillen, Lemons, Olmos
Vice Mayor Hofmeyer, Mayor Hansen
NOES: None
ABSENT: None
ABSTAIN: None

Copies of the complete ordinance are available in
the City Clerk’s office at City Hall, 16400 Color-
ado Avenue, Paramount, California 90723.

For more information, please contact Planning
Director John Carver at 562-220-2048 or jcarv-
er@paramountcity.com.

Paramount Journal
Date of Publication: Thursday, January 9, 2020
Paramount Journal 1/9/2020-91857

FBN Notices-Paramount

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-316726

The following person is
doing business as:
P R E C I S I O N  H A I R
S T U D I O , 1 0 5 1
GLENDON AVE STE
123, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90024. Registered
Owners : SHARIMA
L O P E Z , 4 0 1 6
ABOURNE RD A, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90008.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: SHAR-
I M A L O P E Z . T h i s
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
12/9/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2020-
91843

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2020-001253

The following person is
doing business as: OR-
GANIZED  ENTER-
P R I S E S , 1 0 9 6 2
FA IRBANKS WAY ,
CULVER CITY, CA
90230 . Reg is te red
Owners: LAURA ANNE
M O S E S , 1 0 9 6 2
FA IRBANKS WAY ,
CULVER CITY, CA
90230. This business is
conducted by: Individu-
al. The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
0 1 / 2 0 0 8 . S i g n e d :
L A U R A A N N E
MOSES. This state-
ment was filed with the
County Recorder Of-
fice: 1/3/2020. Notice
— This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2020-
91955

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2020-001577

The following person is
doing business as:
BLUE  BOT88, 9047
CARSON STREET,
CULVER CITY, CA
90232 . Reg is te red
Owners: a. YIN LEE
ULMEN b. ANDREW
PAUL ULMEN, 9047
CARSON STREET,
CULVER CITY, CA
90232. This business is
conducted by: Married
Couple. The date regis-
trant started to trans-
act business under the
f i c t i t i ous bus iness
name or names listed
a b o v e : 0 1 / 2 0 2 0 .
S i g n e d : A N D R E W
PAUL ULMEN. This
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
corder Office: 1/3/2020.
Notice — This Ficti-
tious Name Statement
expires five years from
the date it was filed in
the office of the County
Recorder Office. A new
Fict i t ious Business
Name Statement must
be fi led before that
time. The filing of this
statement does not of
itself authorize the use
in this state of a Ficti-
tious Business Name in
violation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2020-
91956
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FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT
2019-323485

The following person is
doing business as:
JCRUZ, 643 S OLIVE
STREET SUITE #530,
LOS ANGELES, CA
90014 . Reg is te red
Owners: JOEL ISAIAS
CRUZ VALDOVINOS,
643 S OLIVE STREET
SUITE #530 , LOS
ANGELES, CA 90014.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: JOEL
ISAIAS CRUZ VAL-
DOVINOS. This state-
ment was filed with the
County Recorder Of-
fice: 12/17/2019. No-
tice — This Fictitious
Name Statement ex-
pires five years from
the date it was filed in
the office of the County
Recorder Office. A new
Fict i t ious Business
Name Statement must
be fi led before that
time. The filing of this
statement does not of
itself authorize the use
in this state of a Ficti-
tious Business Name in
violation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /02 ,9 ,16 ,23 /2020-
91684

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-323487

The following person is
doing business as:
AVAD  COLLECTION,
7 0 0 W E S T 9 T H
STREET APT #1119,
LOS ANGELES, CA
9 0 0 1 5 - 4 5 2 1 . R e -
g i s t e r e d O w n e r s :
MARIA A. AGUIRRE-
CAMPUSANO, 700
WEST 9TH STREET
A P T # 1 1 1 9 , L O S
ANGELES, CA 90015-
4521. This business is
conducted by: Individu-
al. The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: MARIA A.
A G U I R R E - C A M -
PUSANO. This state-
ment was filed with the
County Recorder Of-
fice: 12/17/2019. No-
tice — This Fictitious
Name Statement ex-
pires five years from
the date it was filed in
the office of the County
Recorder Office. A new
Fict i t ious Business
Name Statement must
be fi led before that
time. The filing of this
statement does not of
itself authorize the use
in this state of a Ficti-
tious Business Name in
violation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /02 ,9 ,16 ,23 /2020-
91685

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-316726

The following person is
doing business as:
P R E C I S I O N  H A I R
S T U D I O , 1 0 5 1
GLENDON AVE STE
123, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90024. Registered
Owners : SHARIMA
L O P E Z , 4 0 1 6
ABOURNE RD A, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90008.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: SHAR-
I M A L O P E Z . T h i s
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
12/9/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2020-
91843
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FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-327175

The following person is
doing business as:
THREE6IXTY, 11287
W A S H I N G T O N
BOULEVARD, CUL-
VER CITY, CA 90230.
AI#ON 200029810088.
Registered Owners:
MAX DEVELOPMENT,
LLC, 11287 WASH-
I N G T O N
BOULEVARD, CUL-
VER CITY, CA 90230.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company. The
date registrant started
to transact business
under the f ict i t ious
bus iness name or
names listed above:
1 2 / 2 0 1 9 . S i g n e d :
DANA AMY SAYLES,
Managing Member .
This statement was
filed with the County
R e c o r d e r O f f i c e :
12/23/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /02 ,9 ,16 ,23 /2020-
91681

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-326471

The following person is
doing business as: a.
SATURN'S  BAR  b.
SATURNSBAR.COM,
11162 BARMAN AV-
ENUE, CULVER CITY,
CA 90230. Registered
Owners: ALEXANDER
CHAN, 11162 BAR-
MAN AVENUE, CUL-
VER CITY, CA 90230.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
12/2019. Signed: AL-
EXANDER CHAN. This
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
12/20/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /02 ,9 ,16 ,23 /2020-
91682

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-323483

The following person is
doing business as:
DIAMQUEST, 550 S
HILL STREET SUITE
# 1 3 0 4 , L O S
ANGELES, CA 90013.
AI #ON 4533449. Re-
g i s t e r e d O w n e r s :
DQUEST INC, 550 S
HILL STREET SUITE
# 1 3 0 4 , L O S
ANGELES, CA 90013.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N / A . S i g n e d : A D -
ESHKUMAR J RATHI,
President. This state-
ment was filed with the
County Recorder Of-
fice: 12/17/2019. No-
tice — This Fictitious
Name Statement ex-
pires five years from
the date it was filed in
the office of the County
Recorder Office. A new
Fict i t ious Business
Name Statement must
be fi led before that
time. The filing of this
statement does not of
itself authorize the use
in this state of a Ficti-
tious Business Name in
violation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /02 ,9 ,16 ,23 /2020-
91683
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FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-306108

The following person is
doing business as:
C R E D I T  R E P A I R
C L O U D , 1 2 5 1 7
VENICE BLVD., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90066.
AI #ON 2576744. Re-
g i s t e r e d O w n e r s :
DANIEL A. ROSEN,
INC, 10866 WASHING-
TON BLVD. #447 ,
CULVER CITY, CA
90232 This business is
conducted by: Corpora-
tion. The date regis-
trant started to trans-
act business under the
f i c t i t i ous bus iness
name or names listed
a b o v e : 0 6 / 2 0 1 8 .
Signed: DANIEL A.
ROSEN, CEO. This
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
11/22/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
12/26/19,1/02,9,16/20-
91480

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-326300

The following person is
doing business as:
SHAYLA  WAXING ,
11708 WASHINGTON
P L A C E , L O S
ANGELES, CA 90066.
Registered Owners:
S H A Y L A E N N I S ,
11708 WASHINGTON
P L A C E , L O S
ANGELES, CA 90066.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: SHAYLA
ENNIS. This statement
was f i led wi th the
County Recorder Of-
fice: 12/20/2019. No-
tice — This Fictitious
Name Statement ex-
pires five years from
the date it was filed in
the office of the County
Recorder Office. A new
Fict i t ious Business
Name Statement must
be fi led before that
time. The filing of this
statement does not of
itself authorize the use
in this state of a Ficti-
tious Business Name in
violation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /02 ,9 ,16 ,23 /2020-
91679

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-327175

The following person is
doing business as:
THREE6IXTY, 11287
W A S H I N G T O N
BOULEVARD, CUL-
VER CITY, CA 90230.
AI#ON 200029810088.
Registered Owners:
MAX DEVELOPMENT,
LLC, 11287 WASH-
I N G T O N
BOULEVARD, CUL-
VER CITY, CA 90230.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company. The
date registrant started
to transact business
under the f ict i t ious
bus iness name or
names listed above:
1 2 / 2 0 1 9 . S i g n e d :
DANA AMY SAYLES,
Managing Member .
This statement was
filed with the County
R e c o r d e r O f f i c e :
12/23/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
1 /02 ,9 ,16 ,23 /2020-
91681

FBN Notices-Paramount

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-301077

The following person is
doing business as:
CAREMORE  MULTI-
SERVICES , 13976
FACADE AVE, PARA-
MOUNT, CA 90723.
Registered Owners:
MARIA DE LA LUZ
G U T I E R R E Z &
MELISSA ARIANNA
J E O N G , 1 3 9 7 6
FACADE AVE, PARA-
MOUNT, CA 90723.
This business is con-
ducted by: Copartners.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: MELISSA
A R I A N N A J E O N G .
This statement was
filed with the County
R e c o r d e r O f f i c e :
11/15/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
12/19,26/19,1/02,9/20-
91054

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-319907

The following person is
doing business as:
FIESTA  DISTRIBU-
TION, 14909 GWEN-
CHRIS CT., PARA-
MOUNT, CA 90723. AI
#ON 3333870. Re-
g i s t e r e d O w n e r s :
ALEGRIA IMPORTS,
INC. , 425 E PICO
BLVD. SUITE D, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90015.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: CLAUDIA
MERCADO, CFO. This
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
12/12/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
12/26/19,1/02,9,16/20-
91477

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-318006

The following person is
doing business as:
F L A S H  A  S M I L E
B O O T H S , 1 3 8 5 2
FACADE AVE, PARA-
MOUNT, CA 90723.
Registered Owners:JE-
SUS A. DE LA CERDA
JR, 13852 FACADE
AVE, PARAMOUNT,
CA 90723. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
Individual. The date re-
g is t ran t s ta r ted to
transact business un-
der the fictitious busi-
ness name or names
listed above: 12/2019.
Signed: JESUS A. DE
LA CERDA JR. This
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
12/10/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
12/26/19,1/02,9,16/20-
91479

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2019-306108

The following person is
doing business as:
C R E D I T  R E P A I R
C L O U D , 1 2 5 1 7
VENICE BLVD., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90066.
AI #ON 2576744. Re-
g i s t e r e d O w n e r s :
DANIEL A. ROSEN,
INC, 10866 WASHING-
TON BLVD. #447 ,
CULVER CITY, CA
90232 This business is
conducted by: Corpora-
tion. The date regis-
trant started to trans-
act business under the
f i c t i t i ous bus iness
name or names listed
a b o v e : 0 6 / 2 0 1 8 .
Signed: DANIEL A.
ROSEN, CEO. This
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
11/22/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
12/26/19,1/02,9,16/20-
91480

Notices-Paramount

 NOTICE OF
PETITION TO
ADMINISTER
ESTATE OF:
ROBERTO R.
BANUELOS
CASE NO.

19STPB11897
To all heirs, beneficiar-
ies, creditors, contin-
gent creditors, and per-
sons who may other-
wise be interested in
the WILL or estate, or
both of ROBERTO R.
BANUELOS.
A P E T I T I O N F O R
PROBATE has been
f i led by ROBERTO
BANUELOS JR. in the
Superior Court of Cali-
fornia, County of LOS
ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR
PROBATE requests
t h a t R O B E R T O
BANUELOS JR. be ap-
pointed as personal
representative to ad-
minister the estate of
the decedent.
THE PETITION re-
quests authority to ad-
minister the estate un-
der the Independent
Administration of Es-
tates Act . (This author-
ity will allow the per-
sonal representative to
take many act ions
without obtaining court
approval. Before tak-
ing certain very import-
ant actions, however,
the personal represent-
ative will be required to
give notice to inter-
ested persons unless
they have waived no-
tice or consented to the
proposed action.) The
independent adminis-
tration authority will be
granted unless an in-
terested person files an
objection to the peti-
tion and shows good
cause why the court
should not grant the
authority.
A HEARING on the pe-
tition will be held in this
c o u r t a s f o l l o w s :
01/24/20 at 8:30AM in
Dept. 2D located at
111 N. HILL ST., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at
the hearing and state
your objections or file
written objections with
the court before the
hearing. Your appear-
ance may be in person
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CRED-
ITOR or a contingent
credi tor of the de-
cedent, you must file
your claim with the
court and mail a copy
to the personal repres-
entative appointed by
the court within the
later of either (1) four
months from the date
of first issuance of let-
ters to a general per-
sonal representative,
as defined in section
58(b) of the California
Probate Code, or (2)
60 days from the date
of mailing or personal
delivery to you of a no-
tice under section 9052
of the California Pro-
bate Code.
Other California stat-
utes and legal author-
i ty may affect your
rights as a creditor.
You may want to con-
sult with an attorney
knowledgeable in Cali-
fornia law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE
the fi le kept by the
court. If you are a per-
son interested in the
estate, you may file
with the court a Re-
quest for Special No-
tice (form DE-154) of
the filing of an invent-
ory and appraisal of es-
tate assets or of any
petition or account as
provided in Probate
Code section 1250. A
Request for Special
Notice form is avail-
able from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
PAUL HORN , ESQ. -
SBN 243227
PAUL HORN LAW
GROUP, PC
1 1 4 0 4 S O U T H
S T R E E T
CERRITOS CA 90703
1/2, 1/9, 1/16/20
CNS-3327273#
THE  PARAMOUNT
JOURNAL
Paramount  Journal
1/2,9,16/2020-91653

NOTICE OF SALE
ABANDONED
PERSONAL
PROPERTY

Notice is hereby given
that the undersigned
intends to sell the per-
sonal proper ty de-
scribed below to en-
force a lien imposed on
said property pursuant
to the California Self
Storage Act. Items will
be sold at www.stor-
agetreasures.com by
competi t ive bidding
ending on January 14,
2020 at 3:30pm. Prop-
erty has been stored
and is located at A-1
Self Storage, 14908
Downey  Ave.,  Para-
mount,  CA  90723 .
Sale subject to cancel-
lation up to the time of
sa le , company re-
serves the right to re-
fuse any online bids.

Property to be sold as
follows: misc. house-
hold goods, computers,
electronics, tools, per-
sonal items, furniture,
clothing, off ice fur-
niture & equipment,
sporting goods, etc.;
belonging to the follow-
ing:

Reneshia Ellis
Aurelia Chavez
Kelonnie Cotton
Imani Johonson
Perla Pereyra
Leah Seanell Brown
Alexander Bojorquez
Margarita Beltran
Gilda Marie Pedraza
Vanesa Contreras
A u c t i o n b y S t o r -
a g e T r e a s u r e s . c o m
800-213-4183
Paramount  Journal
1/2,9/2020-91780

FBN Notices-Paramount
FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT
2019-301077

The following person is
doing business as:
CAREMORE  MULTI-
SERVICES , 13976
FACADE AVE, PARA-
MOUNT, CA 90723.
Registered Owners:
MARIA DE LA LUZ
G U T I E R R E Z &
MELISSA ARIANNA
J E O N G , 1 3 9 7 6
FACADE AVE, PARA-
MOUNT, CA 90723.
This business is con-
ducted by: Copartners.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: MELISSA
A R I A N N A J E O N G .
This statement was
filed with the County
R e c o r d e r O f f i c e :
11/15/2019. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Paramount  Journal-
12/19,26/19,1/02,9/20-
91054

Notices-Paramount

 NOTICE OF
PETITION TO
ADMINISTER
ESTATE OF:
ROBERTO R.
BANUELOS
CASE NO.

19STPB11897
To all heirs, beneficiar-
ies, creditors, contin-
gent creditors, and per-
sons who may other-
wise be interested in
the WILL or estate, or
both of ROBERTO R.
BANUELOS.
A P E T I T I O N F O R
PROBATE has been
f i led by ROBERTO
BANUELOS JR. in the
Superior Court of Cali-
fornia, County of LOS
ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR
PROBATE requests
t h a t R O B E R T O
BANUELOS JR. be ap-
pointed as personal
representative to ad-
minister the estate of
the decedent.
THE PETITION re-
quests authority to ad-
minister the estate un-
der the Independent
Administration of Es-
tates Act . (This author-
ity will allow the per-
sonal representative to
take many act ions
without obtaining court
approval. Before tak-
ing certain very import-
ant actions, however,
the personal represent-
ative will be required to
give notice to inter-
ested persons unless
they have waived no-
tice or consented to the
proposed action.) The
independent adminis-
tration authority will be
granted unless an in-
terested person files an
objection to the peti-
tion and shows good
cause why the court
should not grant the
authority.
A HEARING on the pe-
tition will be held in this
c o u r t a s f o l l o w s :
01/24/20 at 8:30AM in
Dept. 2D located at
111 N. HILL ST., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at
the hearing and state
your objections or file
written objections with
the court before the
hearing. Your appear-
ance may be in person
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CRED-
ITOR or a contingent
credi tor of the de-
cedent, you must file
your claim with the
court and mail a copy
to the personal repres-
entative appointed by
the court within the
later of either (1) four
months from the date
of first issuance of let-
ters to a general per-
sonal representative,
as defined in section
58(b) of the California
Probate Code, or (2)
60 days from the date
of mailing or personal
delivery to you of a no-
tice under section 9052
of the California Pro-
bate Code.
Other California stat-
utes and legal author-
i ty may affect your
rights as a creditor.
You may want to con-
sult with an attorney
knowledgeable in Cali-
fornia law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE
the fi le kept by the
court. If you are a per-
son interested in the
estate, you may file
with the court a Re-
quest for Special No-
tice (form DE-154) of
the filing of an invent-
ory and appraisal of es-
tate assets or of any
petition or account as
provided in Probate
Code section 1250. A
Request for Special
Notice form is avail-
able from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
PAUL HORN , ESQ. -
SBN 243227
PAUL HORN LAW
GROUP, PC
1 1 4 0 4 S O U T H
S T R E E T
CERRITOS CA 90703
1/2, 1/9, 1/16/20
CNS-3327273#
THE  PARAMOUNT
JOURNAL
Paramount  Journal
1/2,9,16/2020-91653

Notices-Paramount

NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE'S SALE TS No.:
VAD.077-159 APN:
6241-031-009 Title Or-
der No.: 1337412CAD
NOTE: THERE IS A
SUMMARY OF THE
I N F O R M A T I O N I N
THIS DOCUMENT AT-
TACHED. YOU ARE IN
DEFAULT UNDER A
D E E D O F T R U S T
DATED 5/26/2017. UN-
LESS YOU TAKE AC-
TION TO PROTECT
YOUR PROPERTY, IT
MAY BE SOLD AT A
PUBLIC SALE. IF YOU
NEED AN EXPLANA-
T I O N O F T H E
N A T U R E O F T H E
P R O C E E D I N G
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. A publ ic
auct ion sale to the
highest bidder for cash,
cashier's check drawn
on a state or national
bank, check drawn by
a state or federal cred-
it union, or a check
drawn by a state or
federal savings and
loan association, or
savings association, or
savings bank specified
in Section 5102 of the
Financial Code and au-
thorized to do busi-
ness in this state will
be held by the duly ap-
po in ted t rus tee as
shown below, of all
right, title, and interest
conveyed to and now
held by the trustee in
the hereinaf ter de-
scribed property under
and pursuant to a Deed
of Trust described be-
low. The sale will be
made, but without cov-
enant or warranty, ex-
pressed or implied, re-
garding title, posses-
sion, or encumbrances,
to pay the remaining
principal sum of the
note(s) secured by the
Deed of Trust, with in-
terest and late charges
thereon, as provided in
the note(s), advances,
under the terms of the
Deed of Trust, interest
thereon, fees, charges
and expenses of the
Trustee for the total
amount (at the time of
the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale)
reasonably estimated
to be set forth below.
The amount may be
greater on the day of
sale. Trustor: ROBERT
L GRAY, A SINGLE
MAN Duly Appointed
T r u s t e e : P R O B E R
AND RAPHAEL, ALC
Recorded 6/7/2017 as
I n s t r u m e n t N o .
20170626694 in book
N/A, page N/A of Offi-
cial Records in the of-
fice of the Recorder of
Los Angeles County,
Cal i forn ia, Date of
Sale: 1/29/2020 at
11:00 AM Place of
Sale: By the fountain
located at 400 Civic
Center Plaza, Pomona,
CA 91766 Amount of
unpaid balance and
o t h e r c h a r g e s :
$500,662.87 Street Ad-
dress or other com-
mon designation of real
property: 14906 CALLE
LAS BRISAS PARA-
MOUNT, CALIFOR-
NIA 90723 The under-
signed Trustee dis-
claims any liability for
any incorrectness of
the street address or
other common desig-
nation, if any, shown
above. If no street ad-
dress or other com-
mon designat ion is
shown, directions to
the locat ion of the
property may be ob-
tained by sending a
written request to the
beneficiary within 10
days of the date of first
publication of this No-
tice of Sale. NOTICE
TO POTENTIAL BID-
DERS: If you are con-
sidering bidding on this
p roper t y l i en , you
should understand that
there are r isks in-
volved in bidding at a
trustee auction. You
will be bidding on a li-
en, not on the property
i t se l f . P lac ing the
highest bid at a trustee
auction does not auto-
matically entitle you to
free and clear owner-
ship of the property.
You should also be
aware that the lien be-
ing auctioned off may
be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder
at the auction, you are
or may be responsible
for paying off all liens
senior to the lien being
auctioned off, before
you can receive clear
title to the property.
You are encouraged to
investigate the exist-
ence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens
that may exist on this
property by contacting
the county recorder's
office or a title insur-
ance company, either
of which may charge
you a fee for this in-
formation. If you con-
sult either of these re-
sources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
deed of trust on the
property. NOTICE TO
PROPERTY OWNER:
The sale date shown
on this notice of sale
may be postponed one
or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pur-
suant to Section 2924g
of the California Civil
Code. The law re-
quires that information
about trustee sale post-
ponements be made
available to you and to
the public, as a cour-
t esy to those no t
present at the sale. If
you w ish to lea rn
whether your sale date
has been postponed,
and, if applicable, the
rescheduled time and
date for the sale of this
property, you may call
(714) 730-2727 or visit
this Internet Web site
www.lpsasap.com, us-
ing the file number as-
signed to this case
VAD.077-159. Informa-
tion about postpone-
ments that are very
short in duration or that
occur close in time to
the scheduled sale
may not immediately
be reflected in the tele-
phone information or
on the Internet Web
site. The best way to
verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
D a t e : 1 2 / 1 9 / 2 0 1 9
P R O B E R A N D
RAPHAEL, ALC 20750
Ventura Blvd. #100
Woodland Hills, Califor-
nia 91364 Sale Line:
(714) 730-2727 Rita
Terzyan, Trustee Sale
Technician A-4713853
0 1 / 0 2 / 2 0 2 0 ,
0 1 / 0 9 / 2 0 2 0 ,
0 1 / 1 6 / 2 0 2 0
Paramount  Journal
1/2,9,16/2020-91393

 NOTICE OF
PETITION TO
ADMINISTER
ESTATE OF:
ROBERTO R.
BANUELOS
CASE NO.

19STPB11897
To all heirs, beneficiar-
ies, creditors, contin-
gent creditors, and per-
sons who may other-
wise be interested in
the WILL or estate, or
both of ROBERTO R.
BANUELOS.
A P E T I T I O N F O R
PROBATE has been
f i led by ROBERTO
BANUELOS JR. in the
Superior Court of Cali-
fornia, County of LOS
ANGELES.
THE PETITION FOR
PROBATE requests
t h a t R O B E R T O
BANUELOS JR. be ap-
pointed as personal
representative to ad-
minister the estate of
the decedent.
THE PETITION re-
quests authority to ad-
minister the estate un-
der the Independent
Administration of Es-
tates Act . (This author-
ity will allow the per-
sonal representative to
take many act ions
without obtaining court
approval. Before tak-
ing certain very import-
ant actions, however,
the personal represent-
ative will be required to
give notice to inter-
ested persons unless
they have waived no-
tice or consented to the
proposed action.) The
independent adminis-
tration authority will be
granted unless an in-
terested person files an
objection to the peti-
tion and shows good
cause why the court
should not grant the
authority.
A HEARING on the pe-
tition will be held in this
c o u r t a s f o l l o w s :
01/24/20 at 8:30AM in
Dept. 2D located at
111 N. HILL ST., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90012
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at
the hearing and state
your objections or file
written objections with
the court before the
hearing. Your appear-
ance may be in person
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CRED-
ITOR or a contingent
credi tor of the de-
cedent, you must file
your claim with the
court and mail a copy
to the personal repres-
entative appointed by
the court within the
later of either (1) four
months from the date
of first issuance of let-
ters to a general per-
sonal representative,
as defined in section
58(b) of the California
Probate Code, or (2)
60 days from the date
of mailing or personal
delivery to you of a no-
tice under section 9052
of the California Pro-
bate Code.
Other California stat-
utes and legal author-
i ty may affect your
rights as a creditor.
You may want to con-
sult with an attorney
knowledgeable in Cali-
fornia law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE
the fi le kept by the
court. If you are a per-
son interested in the
estate, you may file
with the court a Re-
quest for Special No-
tice (form DE-154) of
the filing of an invent-
ory and appraisal of es-
tate assets or of any
petition or account as
provided in Probate
Code section 1250. A
Request for Special
Notice form is avail-
able from the court
clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
PAUL HORN , ESQ. -
SBN 243227
PAUL HORN LAW
GROUP, PC
1 1 4 0 4 S O U T H
S T R E E T
CERRITOS CA 90703
1/2, 1/9, 1/16/20
CNS-3327273#
THE  PARAMOUNT
JOURNAL
Paramount  Journal
1/2,9,16/2020-91653


